CITY OF CROSSVILLE, TN

Police Uniforms

CRO #1383
5/17/2016
2:00 p.m.
2 Year Bid CMS Bob Barkel Greene Summit Bluegrass
Al Tactical| Uniforms Company Military Uniforms | NAFECO | Uniforms
Trousers $ 36.00 | $ 2900 |$ 1810 |$ 39.00|$ 3410|$ 3100|%$ 39.30
Shirt - Long Sleeve $ 43.00 | $ 4040 |$ 1960 |$ 4200 |$ 4235|3% 48.75|$% 48.25
- Short Sleeve $ 41.00 | $ 2645 |$ 1860 |$ 39.00|$ 2520|%$ 37.75|%$ 39.75
Trousers - Class B $ 36.00 | $ 29.40 | no bhid $ 43.00|$% 2925|$ 3575|$ 3125
Shirt-Long Sleeve $ 49.00 | $ 42.00 | no bid $ 5500 |$% 4950 |$ 2950 |$ 29.85
Navy
Shirt-Short Sleeve $ 47.00 | $ 27.00 | no bhid $ 5500 |$% 4625 |$ 2775|%$ 36.65
Navy
Jacket, Winter $ 75.00|$ 104.00 | no bid $ 140.00 | $ 194.00 | $ 213.25 |no bid
Jacket, Windbreaker $ 54.00 | $ 87.00 | no hid $ 162.00|$ 68.85|$% 119.25 | no hid
Duty Belt $ 56.00 | $ 4100 |$ 5210|$ 4700|$ 3820 |$ 2750|$% 57.30
Belt Buckle $ 9.00 | $ 3.10 | $ 550 |$%$ 18.00|$ 3.00 | $ 275|$% 11.15
Lt. Bars $ 8.00 | $ 4.00 | no bid $ 4.00 | $ 9.85|$ 13.25 |no bid
Chevrons-Sgt $ 3.20 | $ 3.00 | no bid $ 350 | $ 4.00 | $ 150 | $ 2.25
-Staff Sgt no bid $ 3.25 | no bid $ 450 | $ 4.00 | $ 3.50 | no bid
Insignia - Hi-Glo $ 9.00 | $ 9.00 | no bid $ 15.00 | $ 8.65 | $ 9.25|$ 2210
- Rho-Glo $ 9.00 | $ 9.00 | no bid $ 15.00 | $ 8.65 | $ 9.25|$% 11.00
Badge - Hi-Glo $ 68.00 | $ 59.95 | no hid $ 7200|$ 6240 |$ 66.75|$ 70.15
- Rho-Glo $ 68.00 | $ 59.95 | no hid $ 7200|$ 6240 |$% 66.75|$ 70.15
Badge - Hat - Hi-Glo $ 60.00 | $ 58.00 | no hid $ 7200|$ 6240 |$ 66.75|$ 73.65
- Rho-Glo $ 60.00 | $ 58.00 | no hid $ 7200|$ 6240 |$ 66.75|$% 73.65
Emblems $ 3.00 | $ 1.00 | no hid $ 175 | $ 195 | $ 3.00 | $ 1.50
Nameplate - gold $ 11.00 | $ 10.50 | no bid $ 9.00 | $ 8.65 | $ 9.25|$% 11.00
- silver $ 11.00 | $ 10.50 | no bid $ 9.00 | $ 8.65 | $ 9.25|$% 11.00
"Service Since" - gold $ 11.00 | $ 10.00 | no bid $ 9.00 | $ 8.65 | $ 9.25|$% 1045
- silver $ 11.00 | $ 10.00 | no bid $ 9.00 | $ 8.65 | $ 9.25|$% 1045
Tie $ 8.00 | $ 4.00 | $ 2.00 | $ 5.00 | $ 395 | $ 375 $ 4.00
Cap, Cold Weather $ 20.00 |$ 17.00 | no bid $ 2300|$ 1950 |$ 2050 |$ 2225
Asp $ 54.00 | $ 8940 |$ 39.00|$ 99.00|$ 7195|$ 91.75|$ 8985
Asp Holder $ 38.00 | $ 35.00 | no hid $ 39.00|$ 3325|$ 36.00$ 3105
Wallet $ 28.00 | $ 15.50 | no bid $ 2400|$ 16.60|$ 13.00 | nohid
Badge - gold $ 60.00 | $ 45.00 | no bid $ 11000 |$ 4520|$ 79.75|$ 16.70
- silver $ 60.00 | $ 41.00 | no bid $ 10500 |$ 4030 |$ 79.75|%$ 16.70
Rain Suit $ 38.00 | $ 39.95 | no hid $ 67.00|$ 13385|% 78.25 |no bid
Water Proof
Fluorescent yellow/green
Traffic Vest $ 8.50 | $ 1800 |$ 26.20|$ 3800 |% 30.00 % 8.50 |no bid
Mesh Type
Fluorescent yellow/green
Hat-Campaign style
Winter Felt $ 89.00|$% 10150|% 96.60 | $ 104.00|$ 4575 |$% 106.00 | $ 105.90
Summer Straw $ 63.00 | $ 66.00 | $ 6210 |$ 71.00|$ 4075|$ 5875|% 6875
Hat Cover $ 12.00 | $ 9.70 | no bid $ 16.00 | $ 5.95 | no bid no bid
Navy Blue
Fluorescent yellow/green
TOTAL BID $1,256.70 | $ 1,21755|$ 339.80 | $1,708.75 | $1,339.05 | $1,493.00 | $1,016.05
larger sizes

extra chg
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