
City of Crossville TN

Paper and Plastic Items

CRO #1540

04/20/2021 2 p.m.

Kartbros LLC SDVOSB* Lebanon Chemical AVM Enterprises** Medline Industries*** Fastenal****

Paper Products: Quantity Price Quantity Price Quantity Price Quantity Price Quantity Price

2-ply toilet paper 96/cs $34.50 96/cs $38.95 80/cs 51.95$                       96/cs 40.25$   80/cs 44.90$    

Junior jumbo roll toilet 

paper 12/cs $19.98 12/cs $21.95 12/cs 18.95$                       8/cs 26.10$   12/cs 36.26$    

Center pull towel 6/cs $24.50 6/cs $24.95 6/cs 28.95$                       6/cs 28.40$   6/cs 36.67$    

Kitchen roll towel 30/cs $21.50 30/cs $21.89 30/cs 19.50$                       30/cs 25.15$   30/cs 28.13$    

Tri-fold paper towel 4000/cs $21.99 4000/cs $19.95 4000/cs 18.00$                       4000/cs 22.09$   4000/cs 25.86$    

Wipes – Pop-up box 100/bx - 8 bx/cs $43.85 900/cs $50.10 152/box 25.00$                       6/cs 38.00$   126/box 6.86$      

Automatic Dispenser 

Towel GP9x400 6 rolls/cs 35.99 6/cs $39.95 1 unit 55.00$                       12/cs 30.18$   6/cs 32.19$    

Automatic Dispenser 

Towel TORK 8030620 No bid No bid 6/cs $49.95 1 unit 58.00$                       6/cs 32.15$   No bid No bid

Center pull towel 2-ply 6/cs $35.99 6/cs $24.95 6/cs 20.40$                       6/cs 16.21$   6/cs 36.67$    

Premium roll towel No bid No bid 6/cs $31.95 85/roll/15/roll Tork $25.75/$55.00 Tork 6/cs 33.25$   6/cs 39.67$    

Roll towel 8x800 6 rolls/cs $19.99 6/cs $23.95 6 rolls/cs $22.00/$58.00 Tork 6/cs 32.12$   6/cs 25.80$    

Plastic Bags:

38x58 poly 100/cs $26.50 100/cs $31.95 100/cs 26.00$                       100/cs 26.80$   100/cs 32.60$    

24x33 liner 1000/cs $21.50 1000/cs $27.95 1000/cs 20.21$                       1000/cs 21.65$   1000/cs 37.90$    

40x48 liner 150/cs $25.50 100/cs $24.95 100/cs 21.71$                       100/cs 24.55$   100/cs 24.38$    

43x47 liner 100/cs $26.50 100/cs $28.95 100/cs 31.80$                       100/cs 42.00$   100/cs 39.76$    

40x48 poly 100/cs $25.50 150/cs $31.95 100/cs 30.50$                       100/cs 31.05$   100/cs 35.11$    

33x40 poly 250/cs $30.50 150/cs $16.75 250/cs 19.47$                       250/cs 17.24$   250/cs 32.55$    

30x37 poly 250/cs $22.50 500/cs $24.95 200/cs 10.50$                       250/cs 10.73$   250/cs 31.30$    

30x36 poly 250/cs $22.50 100/cs $15.95 100/cs 12.74$                       250/cs 30.31$   250/cs 36.38$    

36.5x49 poly 150/cs $28.04 NO BID NO BID 100/cs 14.00$                       100/cs 22.08$   100/cs 19.88$    

15x9x31 garbage 500/cs $25.50 1000/cs $24.95 500/cs star seal 17.56$                       500/cs 30.00$   250/cs 18.48$    



23x10x39 garbage 250/cs $29.50 250/cs $24.50 150/cs star seal 16.71$                       250/cs 29.42$   100/cs 19.22$    

40x48 garbage 150/cs $25.50 100/cs $23.95 100/cs 14.35$                       100/cs 14.30$   100/cs 24.48$    

43x48 black liner 100/cs $19.50 150/cs $22.95 150/cs 21.73$                       150/cs 27.18$   150/cs 33.48$    

22x17x46 garbage 100/cs $25.50 100/cs $22.95 150/cs 23.29$                       125/cs 22.40$   100/cs 36.75$    

43x48 natural liner 200/cs $25.50 200/cs $25.95 200/cs 22.39$                       200/cs 21.81$   200/cs 32.90$    

16x14x36 garbage 250/cs $22.50 250/cs $26.95 200/cs 19.00$                       250/cs 30.31$   250/cs 36.38$    

* Products specs 
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specs

** Time-sensitve 
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