CITY OF CROSSVILLE, TN

Paper Products/Plastic Bags

CRO #1475

5/15/2019

10:00 a.m.

Paper Products:

2 Ply Toilet Paper

medium grade

Junior Jumbo Roll Toilet Paper

economy quality

Center Pull Towel

economy quality

Kitchen Roll towel

premium quality

Tri Fold Paper Towel

economy quality

Wipes-pop up box

Task Mate quality

Automatic Dispenser Towel

Automatic Dispenser

Center Pull Towel 2 ply

Roll Towel premium
Plastic Bags:

38x58 poly bag 2 mil
24x33 regular liner .08 micron
40x46 regular liner 1.3 mil
43x47 regular liner 1.4 mil
40x48 poly bag .16 mic
33x40 poly bag .22 micron
30x37 poly bag .60 mil
30x36 poly bag

15x9x31 15 gal garbage bag .06 mil
23x10x39 33 gal garbage bag 1.1 mil
40x48 40-50 gal garbage bag .95 mil
43x48 black liner .22 micron
22x17x46 40-45 gal garbage bag 1.1 mil
43x48 natural liner .17 mic
16x14x36 20-30 gal garbage bag  |1.1 mil
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All
American
Quan/Case |Poly
* NO BID
* NO BID
* NO BID
* NO BID
* NO BID
* NO BID
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* NO BID
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* 100 $ 15.85
* 500 $ 29.02
* 100 $ 13.80
* 100 $ 18.30
* 150 $ 19.18
* 250 $ 21.98
* 250 $ 18.48
* 200 $ 17.26
* 500 $ 24.78
* 250 $ 21.43
* 150 $ 19.18
* 150 $ 20.62
* 150 $ 17.92
* 150 $ 20.62
* 250 $ 17.98

* Check specifications
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