
Page of Signature required only by Presiding Official.
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Bids opened in How many  

addenda issued:

Contract Time bids and modifications must have been received here by  

days  

I, thus declare the bidding closed, and now will proceed to open  
and read bids and modifications which have been received.  

Regulated Subcontractors Bidders (name, city, license number) Adden 
Ack

Bid 
Secur

Drug 
Free Iran Title VI Unit Price #1 Unit Price #3

Electrical Name

Plumbing

HVAC City

Geotherm License Number

Masonry

Electrical Name

Plumbing

HVAC City

Geotherm License Number

Masonry

Electrical Name

Plumbing

HVAC City

Geotherm License Number

Masonry

Electrical Name

Plumbing

HVAC City $467,800.00 $2.00 $15.00 $50.00
Geotherm License Number

Masonry

Electrical Name

Plumbing

HVAC City

Geotherm License Number

Masonry

Electrical Name

Plumbing

HVAC City $451,500.00 $5.00 $40.00 $40.00
Geotherm License Number

Masonry

Harrodsburg, KY

70787

Currens Construction Services, LLC

X X

Classic Protective Coatings, Inc.

X

D & M Painting Corp.

71563

Clearcreek Coatings, Ltd.

74250

X XShelbyville, TN

Washington, PA

75189

Menomonie, WI

X

New Carlisle, OH

Bid Tab 1 3 INTERSTATE DRIVE TANK RECOATING

1 CROSSVILLE, TENNESSEE
City of Crossville, 392 N. 
Main St., Crossville, TN 

Room 317 120 2:00 P.M., Tuesday, May 25, 2021

Unit Price #2

Medway, OH

68918

J.GilliamHFR Project Number: W207199

Base Bid

XX

X X

American Suncraft

50625

G &L Tank Sandblasting & Coatings, 
LLC

NO BID

NO BID

J.Gilliam

BID UNOPENED DUE TO INSUFFICIENT INFORMATION ON ENVELOPE

BID UNOPENED DUE TO INSUFFICIENT INFORMATION ON ENVELOPE



Regulated Subcontractors Bidders (name, city, license number) Adden 
Ack

Bid 
Secur

Drug 
Free Iran Title VI Unit Price #1 Unit Price #3Unit Price #2Base Bid

Electrical

Name

Plumbing

HVAC City

Geotherm License Number

Masonry

Electrical Name
Plumbing

HVAC City

Geotherm License Number

Masonry

Electrical Name

Plumbing

HVAC City $10.00 $25.00 $100.00
Geotherm License Number

Masonry

Electrical Name

Plumbing

HVAC City

Geotherm License Number

Masonry

Electrical Name

Plumbing

HVAC City

Geotherm License Number

Masonry

Electrical Name

Plumbing

HVAC City $7.00 $90.00
Geotherm License Number

Masonry

Electrical Name

Plumbing

HVAC City $6.00 $25.00 $60.00
Geotherm License Number

Masonry

$874,000.00

NO BID

$558,100.00

NO BID

Albany, KY NO BID

Shelbyville, TN

54893

Huffman Tank & Tower, Inc

36440

Preferred Sandblasting & Painting, LLC

Scott I Enterprise

X X X X XMaryville, TN

67229

Southern Road & Bridge

Tarpon Springs, FL NO BID

67390

Suburban Contractors, LLC

Manassas, VA

X X

N/A

Tank Pro, Inc.

X X X X XNorthport, AL $529,689.00 $25.00

42850

Utility Service Co., Inc.

X X XPerry, GA

14995



Regulated Subcontractors Bidders (name, city, license number) Adden 
Ack

Bid 
Secur

Drug 
Free Iran Title VI Unit Price #1 Unit Price #3Unit Price #2Base Bid

Electrical Name

Plumbing

HVAC City

Geotherm License Number

Masonry

Electrical Name

Plumbing

HVAC City

Geotherm License Number

Masonry

Electrical Name

Plumbing

HVAC City

Geotherm License Number

Masonry

Electrical Name

Plumbing

HVAC City

Geotherm License Number

Masonry

XOmaha, NE

Viking Painting, LLC

X X X X

75577

REJECTED DUE TO BID IRREGULARITIES



Regulated Subcontractors Bidders (name, city, license number) Adden 
Ack

Bid 
Secur

Drug 
Free Iran Title VI Unit Price #1 Unit Price #3Unit Price #2Base Bid

$10.00 $50.00$444,700.00 $40.00Viking Painting, LLC


	Bid Tab

