CITY OF CROSSVILLE, TN

CHEMICALS
CRO #1491
5/15/2019
10:00 a.m.
ZINC-ORTHO SODIUM SODIUM SODIUM NORIT
VENDOR CAUSTIC CAUSTIC PHOSPHATE FLUROSILICIC| BICARBONATE GRANULAR SALT POLYMER PERMANGANATE |THIOSULFATE PAC
(GAL)-50% | (GAL)-25% (GAL) ACID (GALLON) (POUND) BULK (POUND) (GALLON) (GALLON) (GALLON) (POUND)
Corechem Inc.| $ 22300 | $ 1.1200 no bid | $ 2.3900 | $ 0.2756 | $ 0.1105 nobid | $ 12.8900 | $ 2.5490 no bid
Univar USA, Inc.| $ 19760 | $ 0.9270 no bid nobid | $ 0.3400 | $ 0.1238 no bid no bid no bid no bid
Thermodyne Engineering Inc. no bid no bid no bid no bid nobid | $ 0.3242 3.3520 no bid no bid no bid
Shannon Chemical Corp. * no bid no bid | $ 4.2300 | $ 3.4700 no bid no bid nobid | $ 7.5900 no bid no bid
The Dycho Company Inc.*| $ 20700 | $ 0.9110 no bid | $ 2.3000 | $ 0.2500 | $ 0.1310 2.3000 | $ 10.2800 | $ 2.1800 | $ 0.8500
Carus Corporation no bid no bid | $ 4.7300 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Aulick Chemical Solutions no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid | $ 0.8500 |Aquasorb CB5MW
$ 1.3300 |Agquasorb LP39
Specialty Chemical Co. LLC*| $ 21370 | $ 1.0180 no bid | $ 5.0830 | $ 0.3940 no bid no bid | $ 12.2300 | $ 6.6100 no bid
American Development Corp no bid no bid nobid | $ 3.6500 no bid no bid nobid | $ 9.0500 no bid no bid
Chemrite, Inc. no bid nobid | $ 5.2100 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
American Aqua no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid | $ 0.1160 no bid no bid no bid no bid
Geo Specialty Chemicals no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

*see exceptions
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