VENDOR

Corechem Inc.

Univar Solutions.
Shannon Chemical Corp.
Chemrite Inc*

Brenntag Mid-South*
Dycho Company Inc*
Hawkins Inc

Carus LLC

Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc.

PVS Minibulk, Inc.
United Mineral & Chemical Corp.

CAUSTIC
(GAL)-50%
$3.2200
$5.2200
no bid

no bid
$3.5110
$3.5700
$4.6000
no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

CAUSTIC
(GAL)-25%
$1.2310
$1.1722
no bid

no bid
$1.1300
$1.5100
no bid

no bid

no bid
$1.7100
no bid

CRO #1655 Water Treatment Chemicals

3/25/2025 2 P.M. CDT

ZINC-ORTHO SODIUM
PHOSPHATE FLUROSILICIC BICARBONATE
(GAL)ZID (GALLON) 23% (POUND)

no bid $4.4210 $0.4500

no bid $3.8000 $0.7100
$8.0700 no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid
$18.5300 $3.5100 $0.3690
$8.9800 $3.4800 $0.4100

no bid $5.5700 no bid
$7.9200 no bid no bid

no bid no bid $0.3700

no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid

GRANULAR SALT POLYMER PERMANGANATE

BULK (POUND) (GALLON)

$0.1360
$0.1850
no bid
no bid
no bid
$0.1750
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
$4.4400
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

SODIUM

20% Tote
no bid
$11.7000
$17.1700
$11.0900
$13.4850
$11.1000
$15.2100
no bid
no bid
no bid
$10.4500

SODIUM
THIOSULFATE
(GALLON)
$4.1000
no bid

no bid

no bid
$3.4490
$3.4900
$8.2200
no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

NORIT
PAC
(POUND)
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
$1.3700
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid




