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ZINC-ORTHO SODIUM SODIUM SODIUM NORIT
VENDOR CAUSTIC CAUSTIC PHOSPHATE FLUROSILICIC BICARBONATE GRANULAR SALT COAGULANT PERMANGANATE THIOSULFATE PAC

(GAL)-50% (GAL)-25% (GAL) ACID (GALLON) (POUND) BULK (POUND) (GALLON) Tote (GALLON) (POUND)
Univar Solutions. 4.7574$    No bid No bid 3.9000$              0.5920$             0.1775$                  No bid 10.4100$               3.8730$            No bid
Shannon Chemical Corp. No bid No bid 9.17$             No bid No bid No bid No bid 14.1400$               No bid No bid
Carus Corporation No bid No bid 9.0200$         No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
Chemrite Inc No bid No bid 7.6500$         No bid No bid No bid No bid 10.4400$               No bid No bid
Brenntag Mid-South 3.6000$    No bid 16.5000$       No bid 0.3499$             0.1749$                  No bid 13.6100$               No bid No bid
Dycho Company Inc 3.7500$    No bid 9.4100$         3.8800$              0.3600$             0.1775$                  4.4400$         11.1000$               3.4900$            1.1800$ 
Hawkins Inc 3.5400$    No bid No bid 5.3700$              No bid No bid No bid 10.4400$               8.2200$            No bid
United Mineral No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 13.7700$               No bid No bid
Thermadyne No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 5.3850$         No bid No bid No bid

** LOOK AT THE BID FOR NOTES FROM BIDDER
Winning bidders in yellow
Lowest bidder for Salt and Coagulant does not meet spec requirements 


