Medical Screenings

CRO #1492
5/15/2019
10 a.m. CDT

Exacare TN Drug & Alcohol Center

Non-CDL CDL Non-CDL CDL

Random-Safety Sensitive Employees No bid $ 55.00 S 45.00 | $ 45.00
Random-CDL N/A $ 55.00 N/A $ 45.00
Blood Alcohol-CDL N/A S 40.00 N/A S 25.00
Drug Screens:
Post-Accident w/injury No bid $ 55.00 S 45.00 | $ 45.00
Post-Accident w/o injury No bid S 55.00 S 45.00 S 45.00
Reasonable Suspicion No bid $ 55.00 S 45.00 | $ 45.00
Outside regular office hours N/A No bid S 45.00 $ 45.00
Post-Employment Offer drug screen S 129.00 ' S 150.00 N/A N/A
w/physical
Post-Employe Offer w/drug screen, S 35.00 | $ 35.00 N/A N/A
pulmonary function test & FIT test
(firemen only)
Annual Respiratory FIT test N/A N/A N/A N/A

(police and fire)

*plus $45 on-site fee

Turn-around time

Within 48 hours

3-5 days, up to 10 days

MRO & Laboratory

Donald S. Freedman/LabCorp inc.

Steven Paschall/Medtox Lab

C.L.I.A. certified

Yes

Yes




	Sheet1

