
CITY OF CROSSVILLE, TN

Fire Uniforms

CRO #1565

4/20/2021

2:00 p.m. CDT

ITEMS* Summit Uniforms CMS Uniforms NAFECO

1. Shirts

Short sleeve 43.61$                      33.00$               $38.00 - 52.75

Long Sleeve 47.05$                      36.00$               $42.00 - 58.75

Tactical short sleeve 42.46$                      52.00$               No bid

Tactical long sleeve 47.05$                      57.30$               No bid

2. Trousers

Tactical Pants 57.19$                      61.00$               $44.50 - 52.75

APEX Pants 52.06$                      56.45$               No bid

Stryke Pant 38.56$                      59.50$               No bid

3. Outerwear

Tactical softshell 72.77$                      $75.00 - 88.75 $83.61 - 103.78

Winter parka 281.14$                    216.50$             No bid

Jobshirt 46.25$                      54.00$               No bid

4. Footwear

Duty boot 55.03$                      93.00$               No bid

Crush boot 91.14$                      95.95$               No bid

Crush shoe 79.53$                      83.75$               No bid

5. Accessories

Belt 30.98$                      75.55$               No bid

Uniform belt 20.05$                      20.70$               $27.50 - 33.00

6. Badges/Insginia

Firefighter badge 82.35$                      83.00$               90.75$                           

Nameplate 26.33$                      27.00$               $26.50 - 27.00

Collar pins 31.05$                      18.45$               $18.75 - 20.75

Dress hat badge (bugles) $     37.80 - 40.50 $ 19.45 - 20.85 $18.75 - 19.50

7. Dress Uniforms

Uniform coat 122.92$                    142.00$             $158.00 - 188.00

Uniform pants 35.64$                      38.65$               64.00$                           

Dress tie 6.08$                        $    4.50 - 6.75 $6.00 - 8.00

Tie bar 19.91$                      21.00$               $8.00

Dress shoes 60.75$                      60.00$               62.00$                           

Dress hat - Blue Bell Crown 54.00$                      48.00$               $52.00 - 69.80

Dress hat - white all vinyl crown 54.00$                      81.00$               $53.00 - 68.80

Dress hat - bell/black velvet 54.00$                      86.00$               $53.00 - 68.80

*Bids have brands, styles, 

pricing/size, quantity pricing


