

CITY OF CROSSVILLE, TN

Crushed Stone
CRO #1589
4/19/2022
2 p.m. CDT

| (Delivered to Public Works) | 33C | 3/4 inch | 1 1/2 inch | 1/2 inch | 1/4 inch | Rip Rap | RCA 02 2 X 4 | RCA 71 4 X 6 | #2 Stone 1-1/2" x 3" |
|-----------------------------------|------------|-----------------|-------------------|-----------------|-----------------|----------------|-------------------------|-------------------------|---------------------------------|
| Rogers Group | \$ 13.25 | \$ 17.50 | No bid | \$ 17.50 | No bid | \$ 18.00 | No bid | No Bid | \$ 17.50 |
| Lhoist North America of TN | \$ 14.00 | \$ 18.70 | \$ 18.00 | \$ 18.70 | \$ 14.25 | No bid | No bid | \$ 18.75 | \$ 18.70 |

| (Picked up by City truck) | 33C | 3/4 inch | 1 1/2 inch | 1/2 inch | 1/4 inch | Rip Rap | RCA 02 2 X 4 | RCA 71 4 X 6 | #2 Stone 1-1/2" x 3" |
|-----------------------------------|------------|-----------------|-------------------|-----------------|-----------------|----------------|-------------------------|-------------------------|---------------------------------|
| Rogers Group | \$ 8.25 | \$ 12.50 | no bid | \$ 12.50 | no bid | \$ 13.00 | no bid | no bid | \$ 12.50 |
| Lhoist North America of TN | \$ 9.25 | \$ 13.95 | \$ 13.25 | \$ 13.95 | \$ 9.50 | no bid | No bid | \$ 14.00 | \$ 13.95 |