
CITY OF CROSSVILLE, TN

CHEMICALS

CRO #1451

5/15/2018

10:00 a.m.

SODIUM SODIUM
VENDOR PERMANGANATE THIOSULFATE

(GALLON) (GALLON)

Corechem Inc. $ 2.5100 $ 2.3950 $ 0.2445 $ 0.1094 $              8.9000 $         2.4100

American Development Corp $ 3.6500 $              8.9900 no bid

Thermodyne Engineering Inc. $ 3.3520 no bid no bid

Shannon Chemical Corp. $ 4.4700 $ 2.7200 $              7.6300 $         2.2300

The Dycho Company Inc.* $ 2.6200 $ 2.5000 $ 0.2530 $ 0.1270 $              7.6800 $         2.2000 $ 0.8300

Carus Corporation $ 4.5650 no bid no bid

Sullivan Corp. $ 0.1090 no bid no bid

Specialty Chemical Co. LLC* $ 2.2900 $ 4.0000 $ 0.3500 no bid $         3.5500

*see exceptions

ZINC-ORTHO SODIUM NORIT
CAUSTIC PHOSPHATE FLUROSILICIC BICARBONATE GRANULAR SALT POLYMER PAC

(GAL) (GAL) ACID (GALLON) (POUND) BULK (POUND) (GALLON) (POUND)
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no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid
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no bid no bid no bid no bid


