CITY OF CROSSVILLE, TN

PLASTIC PIPE
CRO#1247
05/15/2013
2:00 P.M. Superior Hayes
Drainage Products Southern Pipe & Supply Pipe Supply
Pipe Band Total Pipe Band Total Pipe Band Total
8" HDPE Type SAASHTO 294 $ 4.00 | $ 525|% 925|% 267 | $ 1368 | $ 1635 | $ 3.29 no bid
12" HDPE Type SAASHTO 294 $ 487 | $ 790 | $ 1277 | $ 472 | $ 1124 |$ 1596 | $ 4.70 no bid
15" HDPE Type SAASHTO 294 $ 656 |$ 13.00|$ 1956 | $ 6.00 | $ 2162 |$ 2762 |$ 6.06 no bid
18" HDPE Type SAASHTO 294 $ 887 |$% 2250 |% 3137 |% 8.56 | $ 41.96 | $ 5052 | $ 8.23 no bid
24" HDPE Type SAASHTO 294 $ 1435 | $ 3150 | $ 4585 (% 1361 | $ 51.98 | $ 6559 | $ 14.17 no bid
30" HDPE Type SAASHTO 294 $ 2130|$ 73.00|% 9430 % 2222 | $ 95.74 | $117.96 | $ 19.99 no bid
36" HDPE Type SAASHTO 294 $ 2700|$ 102.00 | $129.00 | $ 25.86 | $ 217.52 | $243.38 [ $ 27.05 no bid
48" HDPE Type SAASHTO 294 $ 4380|$ 175.00 | $218.80 | $ 4141 | $ 451.26 | $492.67 | $ 43.51 no bid
60" HDPE Type SAASHTO 294 $ 75.60 | $ 273.00 | $348.60 | $ 94.44 | $ 358.24 | $452.68 | $ 76.44 no bid
Tay's
The Feed Store Septic
Pipe Band Total Pipe Band Total
8" HDPE Type SAASHTO 294 $ 3.09 | $ 325|% 634(% 264 $ 759 $ 10.23
12" HDPE Type SAASHTO 294 $ 486 | $ 550 | $ 1036 | $ 443 $ 482 $ 925
15" HDPE Type SAASHTO 294 $ 642 |$ 1085 |% 1727 |$ 567 $ 9.27 $ 14.94
18" HDPE Type SAASHTO 294 $ 809 |$ 2164 |$% 2973 |% 8.08 $ 1492 $ 23.00
24" HDPE Type SAASHTO 294 $ 1354 |$ 3015 |% 4369 |% 1295 $ 2230 $ 35.25
30" HDPE Type SAASHTO 294 $ 2108|$ 70.00|$ 91.08]|% 21.00 $ 47.87 $ 68.87
36" HDPE Type SAASHTO 294 $ 26.33 | $ 76.42 | $102.75 | $ 2443 $ 90.98 $115.41
48" HDPE Type SAASHTO 294 $ 4148 |$ 17468 | $216.16 | $ 39.13 $ 210.00 $249.13
60" HDPE Type SAASHTO 294 no bid no bid nobid [$ 81.00 $ 319.00 $400.00




