

CITY OF CROSSVILLE, TN					
Police Uniforms					
CRO #1564					
4/20/2021					
2:00 p.m. CDT					
	<b>Summit Uniforms</b>	<b>NAFECO</b>	<b>CMS Uniforms</b>	<b>Keisler Police Supply Inc</b>	
<b>Dress - (Class A)</b>					
Trousers	\$ 35.37	\$ 43.75	\$ 32.00	No Bid	
Long sleeve shirt	\$ 38.70	\$ 57.25	\$ 45.82	No Bid	
Short Sleeve shirt	\$ 29.19	\$ 50.00	\$ 29.40	No Bid	
Tie	\$ 4.05	\$ 4.70	\$ 4.00	No Bid	
<b>Duty Uniform</b>					
Trousers	\$ 57.67	\$ 47.65	\$ 56.29	No Bid	
Long Sleeve shirt	\$ 55.89	\$ 42.70	\$ 53.15	No Bid	
Short Sleeve shirt	\$ 51.42	\$ 39.94	\$ 48.57	No Bid	
<b>Other</b>					
Winter coat	\$ 87.62	\$ 83.61	\$ 71.00	No Bid	
Windbreaker	\$ 151.15	\$ 92.00	\$ 76.00	No Bid	
<b>Equipment</b>					
Holster, Duty	\$ 92.06	\$ 86.00	\$ 92.45	\$ 73.00	
Mag Pouch	\$ 32.06	\$ 40.00	\$ 34.75	No bid	
Cold Weather cap	\$ 10.38	\$ 10.56	\$ 6.90	No Bid	
Boots, Duty	\$ 124.20	\$ 139.15	\$ 121.05	No bid	
Boots, Winter	\$ 130.95	\$ 146.71	\$ 127.63	No bid	
<b>Accessories</b>					
Wallet	\$ 10.30	\$ 23.25	\$ 14.20	No bid	
Duty Belt	\$ 43.61	\$ 62.41	\$ 48.45	No bid	
Belt Buckle	\$ 5.67	\$ 3.50	\$ 6.00	No bid	
ASP	\$ 103.59	\$ 130.00	\$ 108.15	No bid	
ASP Holder	\$ 37.44	\$ 47.34	\$ 38.68	No bid	
Lt. / Cpt. Bars	\$ 5.00	\$ 6.38	\$ 4.75	No bid	
<b>Chevrons</b>					
Sgt.	\$ 5.00	\$ 6.38	\$ 4.75	No bid	
Corporal / Private	\$ 3.00	\$ 6.38	\$ 4.75	No bid	
Insignia-Gold	\$ 23.50	\$ 21.20	\$ 12.00	No bid	
Insignia-Silver	\$ 19.50	\$ 21.20	\$ 12.00	No bid	
Nameplate-Gold	\$ 11.50	\$ 13.71	\$ 11.25	No Bid	
Nameplate-Silver	\$ 11.50	\$ 13.71	\$ 11.25	No Bid	
Service Since Pin-Gold	\$ 11.50	\$ 13.04	\$ 13.10	No Bid	
Service Since Pin-Silver	\$ 11.50	\$ 13.04	\$ 13.10	No Bid	
<b>Badges</b>					
Shirt, Hi Glo	\$ 74.00	\$ 75.28	\$ 75.30	No bid	
Shirt, Rho-Glo	\$ 74.00	\$ 75.28	\$ 75.30	No bid	
Badge Holder, Clip On	\$ 12.66	\$ 11.25	\$ 14.60	No bid	
Badge Holder, w/Chain	\$ 13.34	\$ 14.83	\$ 14.60	No bid	
Patches, City of Crossville	\$ 2.75	\$ 1.94	\$ 1.20	No Bid	
<b>*BIDS include vendors, style #, exceptions and other requirements</b>					