

Solid Waste Collection Services

6/6/2017

2:00 p.m.

	Waste Connections dba CWD	Santek Waste Services
Checklist	X	Not provided
Contractor's Bid		
Base Bid - Residential	\$ 5.17	\$ 8.76
Base Bid-Bulky Waste	\$ 5.00	No Bid
Add Alternate - Yard Waste		
Leaves-2 times per year	\$ 1.72	No Bid
Leaves - On call pickups	\$ 35.00	No Bid
Yard Waste-2 times per year	\$ 1.73	No Bid
Yard Waste - on call pickups	\$ 25.00	No Bid
Municipal Collection - carts per pick-up	\$ 2.40	\$ 2.50
Municipal Collection - dumpster rental/mo	\$ -	\$ 27.00
Municipal Collection - dumpsters per month	\$ 38.00	\$ 77.00
Municipal collection - roll-offs		
Haul rate per pull	\$ 75.00	\$ 141.00
Landfill fee per ton	\$ 34.00	\$ 49.00
Roll-off rental per day	\$ 3.00	\$ 5.00
Disposal Site	Meadow Branch Athens	Meadow Branch Athens
Bid Security	X	X
Certificate of Insurance	X	X
Performance Bond assurance letter	X	X
Itemized list of equipment	X	X
Latest certified financial statement	Annual report	X
Evidence of good standing	X	X
Evidence of 5 years of experience	X	X
Evidence of authority to use disposal sites	X	Not provided
Iran Divestment Act acknowledgement	X	X
Title VI Assurance	X	X
Acknowledgement of addendums	X	X