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Water Line Supplies

CRO# 1684

3/20/2026

2 p.m, CDT

Core & Main

Saddles {Smith Bilair)

2"x 3/4" cc $ 30.21
2"x1"ce $ 30.21
3"x3/4" cc $ 32.63
3"x1"cc $ 32.63
Ix2"LP.T. $ 39.76
4" % 3/14" cc $ 41.71
4"x1"cc $ 41.71
4"x2"I.P.T. $ 44.44
6" x3/4"cc 3 42.92
6"x1"cc $ 42,92
6"x2"LP.T. 3 52.28
8"x3/4" cc $ 46.98
8"x1"cc B 46,98
8"'x2"1.P.T. $ 58.62
10" x 3/4" cc 3 57.15
10" x 17 co $ 57.15
10" x 2" LP.T. 3 73.75
12"x 3/4" ¢cc $ 61.34
12"x1" cc $ 61.34
12"x 2" I.LP.T. $ 77.74
14" x 3/4" cc $ 72.44
14"x1"cc $ 72.44
14"x 2" LP.T. $ 88.24
16" x 3/4" cc 3 85.98
16"x1"cc 3 85.98
16" x 2" LLP.T. 3 106.50
Encoder module with Itron 5° cable Part#965-110-66 No bid

Corp Stops (Ford) %" F1000-3-Q NL 5. 38.40
Corp Stops (Ford) %" FB1000-3-Q NL, 300 PSI 3 56.81
Coupling for %" service tubing brass C44-33-Q CRSXCTS NL $ 21.44
3/4" PE Municipex CTS Service Tubing 500’ coils (per ff) $ 1.02

G&C Supply Co
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156.47

42.06
61.67
23.27
465.00

Consolidated Pipe Furguson
& Supply
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48.55
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110.60

161.00
37.15
54.00
20.75

Waterworks
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440.00 (.88/ft) $

30.83
31.49
30.83
38.00
50.39
39.64
39.64
53.21
44.57
44,57
56.80
50.22
50.22
69.42
67.60
67.60
93.31
85.43
85.43
110.29
97.87
89.93
121.72
118.60
118.60
146.91

42.99
63.23
23.98
424.13
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Fortiline
Waterworks
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31,33
33.84
33.84
41.25
40.10
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46.10
44.52
44.52
54.23
48.67
48.67
60.81
59.29
59.29
76.51
62.97
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79.81
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79.81
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109.35
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1" PE Municipex CTS Service Tubing 500 coil (per i}
Smith Blair 3/4" x 3" full circle clamp for service tubing
18" plastic meter box (Carson-Brooks) plastic lid

3/4" Meter yokes (Ford) 7" rise

Brass Saddles (Ford)
2" x 34"
2“‘ x 1!1

4" x 34"
%1
4"x2"

6" x 3/4"
6“ x 1I'l

6" x2"

8" x 3/4"
g"x1"
10" x 3/4"
10"x1°

2" Ford Setter w/ball valve, wicheck valve & bypass (A)

2" Ford Setter w/ball valve, w/check valve & bypass (B)

17" x 30" plastic meter box 18"

15" concrete meter box w/C1 reader flip lid

1" Ford meter yoke 10" rise w/double check vaive w/locking
ball valve

Octave Meters:

2" Octave Meter
3" Octave Meter
4" Octave Meter
6" Octave Meter
2" Octave Meter
3" Octave Meter
4" Octave Meter
6" Octave Meter

3G DS Encoder XTR 199-004-50

3G DS Encoder Module 865-010-16

DLG 3G DS Fast Pulse DLG 199-004-57
Octobe Double Pulse Output ADA 9865-010-19

$ 1.53
3 22.50
$ 53.21
$ 200.98
$ 24.10
$ 24.10
$ 37.42
$ 37.42
3 75.39
$ 55.84
$ 55,84
$ 105.36
3 76.74
3 76.74
$ 148.05
$ 148.05
) 1,182.13
$ 1,220.12
3 176.73
No bid

341.44
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
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No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

700.00
30.31
61.33

216.18

26.40
26.40
41.00
41.00
86.70
60.06
60.06
113.32
82.54
82.54
159.25
159.25

1,271.59
1,312.45
248.04
50.21

367.28
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PN

640.00 (1.28/f)
19.71

57.45

195.00

30.29
30.29
37.94
37.94
81.67
56.59
56.59
105.67
77.77
FLTT
150.00
150.00

1,185.00
1,222.25
178.72
53.50

329.75

1,897.50
2,350.00
3,136.00
4,850.00

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

€N A H

158.00
195.00
170.00
285.00

P A

N 9 &6 NN HOHARPAPOANANAAALN

No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

615.79 1.16/ft

10.53 No hid
4895 $ 58.00
19246 % 206.36
2749 § 25.00
2749 $ 25.00
4269 § 38.82
4269 § 38.82
8595 % 87.92
63.70 § 57.92
63.70 § 57.92
12020 $ 109.30
8755 § 79.61
8755 % 79.61
168.81 $ 152.00
16891 $ 152.00
1,360.13 $ 1,213.80
1,40384 % 1,252.80

328.69 No bid
4918 % 43.75
39285 $ 361.40

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid



