Water Line Supplies

CRO# 1615
5/23/2023
2p.m.CDT
Consolidated
Pipe & Supply

Inc Core & Main
Saddles (Smith Blair) ** AY McDonald (FORD)
2" x 3/4" cc $ 18.98 $ 22.95
2" x1" cc $ 18.98 $ 22.95
3" x 3/4" cc $ 20.85 $ 28.88
3"x1"cc $ 20.85 $ 28.88
3"x 2" I.P.T. $ 30.85 $ 31.60
4" x 3/4" cc $ 30.41 $ 30.99
4" x 1" cc $ 30.41 $ 30.99
4" x 2" I.P.T. $ 39.85 $ 37.40
6" x 3/4" cc $ 34.60 $ 31.87
6" x 1" cc $ 34.60 $ 31.87
6" x 2" I.LP.T. $ 39.56 $ 37.60
8" x 3/4" cc $ 44.50 $ 35.14
8" x 1" cc $ 44.50 $ 35.14
8" x 2" I.P.T. $ 48.30 $ 47.50
10" x 3/4" cc $ 47.60 $ 46.25
10" x 1" cc $ 47.60 $ 46.25
10" x 2" I.P.T. $ 57.50 $ 58.04
12" x 3/4" cc $ 54.18 $ 58.46
12" x 1" cc $ 54.18 $ 58.46
12" x 2" I.P.T. $ 67.65 $ 72.04
14" x 3/4" cc $ 111.58 $ 75.95
14" x 1" cc $ 111.58 $ 75.95
14" x 2" I.P.T. $ 100.18 $ 79.01
16" x 3/4" cc $ 112.43 $ 88.13
16" x 1" cc $ 112.43 $ 88.13
16" x 2" I.P.T. $ 114.01 $ 95.36
Master Meter 5/8" x 3/4" $ 241.42 NO BID
Master Meter 1" $ 331.42 NO BID

Master Meter 1 1/2" $ 628.57 NO BID
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2" Meter with flange connector $ 827.14 NO BID
2" DB compound meter NO BID NO BID
3" DB compound meter NO BID NO BID
4" DB compound meter NO BID NO BID
Corp Stops (Ford) 3/4" F1000-3-Q NL 43.71* $ 35.95
Corp Stops (Ford) 3/4" FB1000-3-Q NL, 300 PSI 64.64** $ 53.21
Coupling for 3/4" service tubing brass 24.39** $ 20.08
3/4" PE Municipex CTS Service Tubing 500’ coils .94/ft 1.05/ft
1" PE Municipex CTS Service Tubing 500' coil 1.37/ft 1.44/ft
Smith Blair 3/4" x 3" full circle clamp for service tubing $ 20.15 $ 24.10
18" plastic meter box (Carson-Brooks) plastic lid $ 52.00 $ 59.80
3/4" Meter yokes (Ford) 7" rise $ 230.00 $ 188.20
Brass Saddles (Ford)
2" x 3/4" $ 29.42 $ 22.54
2"x 1" $ 29.42 $ 22.54
4" x 3/4" $ 41.19 $ 35.00
4"x 1" $ 41.19 $ 35.00
4" x 2" $ 88.64 $ 75.38
6" x 3/4" $ 61.43 $ 52.22
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6" x 1" $ 61.43 $ 52.22
6" x 2" $ 115.89 $ 98.53
8" x 3/4" $ 84.40 $ 71.76
8" x 1" $ 84.40 $ 71.76
10" x 3/4" $ 168.59 $ 138.46
10" x 1" $ 168.59 $ 138.46
2" Ford Setter w/ball valve, w/check valve & bypass

VBH77-12B-11-77 $ 1,376.48 $ 1,107.22

VBH77-15B-11-77 $ 1,420.56 $  1,142.79
17" x 30" plastic meter box 18" $ 166.00 $ 185.00
15" concrete meter box w/C1 reader flip lid $ 52.00 NO BID
1" Ford meter yoke 10" rise w/double check valve $ 387.80 $ 319.79
w/locking ball valve
Master Meter Register 5/8" USG 3G DS-Optics-NL $ 184.00 NO BID
Master Meter Register 5/8" USG 3G DS-Interpreter LCD $ 192.00 NO BID
Octave Meters:
2" Octave Meter w/epoxi NO BID NO BID
3" Octave Meter w/epoxi NO BID NO BID
4" Octave Meter w/epoxi NO BID NO BID
6" Octave Meter w/epoxi NO BID NO BID
2" Octave Meter SIS $ 1,626.95 NO BID
3" Octave Meter SIS $ 2,021.00 NO BID
4" Octave Meter SIS $ 2,690.00 NO BID
6" Octave Meter SIS $ 4,270.00 NO BID

3G DS Encoder XTR 199-004-50 $ 135.45 NO BID
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3G DS Encoder Module 965-010-16 $ 131.26 NO BID
DLG 3G DS Fast Pulse DLG 199-004-57 $ 137.60 NO BID
Octobe Double Pulse Output ADA 965-010-19 $ 257.26 NO BID
Badger Meters:
Badger, M25, 5/8" X 3/4" Disc Meter NO BID NO BID
Badger M55, 1" Disc Meter NO BID NO BID
Badger M120, 1-1/2" Disc Meter NO BID NO BID
Badger, M170, 2" Disc Meter NO BID NO BID
Badger, 2" T-200 Turbo Series Meter NO BID NO BID
Badger, 3" T-450 Turbo Series Meter NO BID NO BID
Badger, 4" T-1000 Turbo Series Meter NO BID NO BID
Badger, 6" T-2000 Turbo Series Meter NO BID NO BID
Badger, 2" Compound Series Meter, NO BID NO BID
Badger, 3" Compound Series Meter NO BID NO BID
Badger, 4" Compound Series Meter NO BID NO BID
Badger, 6" Compound Series Meter NO BID NO BID

* Alternate Badger E Series: 2"=stainless steel, 3"-6" E-Series bronze; all include 25-ft Itron inline connector



