
Asphalt Delivered (Hot Mix)
CRO #1631
4/23/2024
2 p.m. CDT

411-E 307-C
Rogers Group 121.00$            118.00$                  

Asphalt Picked Up
CRO #1632
4/23/2024
2 p.m. CDT

411-E 307-C
Rogers Group 95.00$              85.00$                    

BULK COARSE SALT
CRO #1633
4/23/2024
2 p.m. CDT

Salt
F.O.B.

Salt
Picked up

Sodium
Chloride F.O.B.

Sodium
Chloride
Picked up

Morton Salt Inc 141.71$            91.00$                                           134.17$                  130.00$                                      
Compass Minerals No bid No bid 139.75$                  135.00$                                      
Univar No bid No bid No bid No bid
Dycho Company No bid No bid No bid No bid

Water Treatment Chemicals
CRO #1637
4/23/2024
2 p.m. CDT

ZINC-ORTHO SODIUM SODIUM SODIUM NORIT
VENDOR CAUSTIC CAUSTIC PHOSPHATE FLUROSILICIC BICARBONATE GRANULAR SALT POLYMER PERMANGANATE THIOSULFATE PAC

(GAL)-50% (GAL)-25% (GAL) ACID (GALLON) (POUND) BULK (POUND) (GALLON) Tote (GALLON) (POUND)
Corechem Inc. $3.2930 $1.1440 no bid $4.4390 no bid $0.1240 no bid no bid $4.2670 no bid
Univar Solutions. $4.9500 no bid no bid $3.5200 $0.7240 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Shannon Chemical Corp. no bid no bid 10.27$                    4.47$                                          no bid no bid no bid 11.73$                  no bid no bid
Carus Corporation* no bid no bid 8.91$                      no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Chemrite Inc* no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $11.420 no bid no bid
Brenntag Mid-South* $3.9570 $1.3800 $19.7700 $4.2350 $0.4300 no bid no bid $13.350 $3.5000 no bid
Dycho Company Inc* $4.0400 $1.5600 $10.0800 $3.8000 $0.4100 $0.1700 no bid $11.300 $4.0500 $1.3700
Hawkins Inc 4.32$                no bid No bid 6.50$                                          no bid no bid no bid 16.64$                  9.50$               no bid
Southeastern Tank $5.1900 $2.7802 no bid $4.1162 no bid no bid no bid $18.950 no bid no bid



Fertilizer
CRO #1638
4/23/2024
2 p.m. CDT

Site One Landscape Supply - Knoxville

Quantity Bag Ton
07/01/2024 Delivery
LESCO 33-0-3 50% U-PLUS BIO 2Fe 50# 90 $26.0790 2,347.11$               
 (Alt. for 33-3-5 no longer available)
LESCO 32-0-8 40% NOS PLUS BIO 2Fe 50# 74 $27.5370 2,037.74$               
(Alt. for 32-3-8)
Fertilizer/Insecticide 0-0-7 plus Acelepryn 0.067% 105 $42.3640 4,448.22$               
LESCO 18-24-12 25% NOS PLUS BIO 50# 130 $29.8980 3,886.74$               
(Alt. for 18-24-12 25% SCU)
03/01/2025 Delivery
Dimension .15% 19-0-6 30% Polyplus LESCO 148 $27.8150 4,116.62$               
(Alt. for 19-0-6 with .15 dimension)
21-0-0 AS Mpac Compacted SGN 170 95 $35.0020 3,325.19$               
Fertilizer/Insecticide 0-0-7 plus Acelepryn 0.067% 105 $42.3640 4,448.22$               
05/03/2025 Delivery 
Dimension .15% 19-0-6 30% Polyplus LESCO 153 $27.8150 4,255.70$               
(Alt. for 19-0-6 with .15 dimension)
Fertilizer 5-10-31 A/C with 10% FE 50 $16.1480 807.40$                  
LESCO 33-0-3 50% U-PLUS BIO 2Fe 50# 90 $26.0790 2,347.11$               
 (Alt. for 33-3-5 no longer available)

32,020.05$             

Quantity Bag Ton
07/01/2024 Delivery
LESCO 33-0-3 50% U-PLUS BIO 2Fe 50# 90 NO BID
 (Alt. for 33-3-5 no longer available)
LESCO 32-0-8 40% NOS PLUS BIO 2Fe 50# 74 $28.53 2,111.22$               
(Alt. for 32-3-8)
Fertilizer/Insecticide 0-0-7 plus Acelepryn 0.067% 105 $46.56 4,888.80$               
LESCO 18-24-12 25% NOS PLUS BIO 50# 130 $30.76 3,998.80$               
(Alt. for 18-24-12 25% SCU)
03/01/2025 Delivery
Dimension .15% 19-0-6 30% Polyplus LESCO 148 $30.50 $4,514.00
(Alt. for 19-0-6 with .15 dimension)
21-0-0 AS Mpac Compacted SGN 170 95 $23.22 2,205.90$               
Fertilizer/Insecticide 0-0-7 plus Acelepryn 0.067% 105 $46.56 4,888.80$               
05/03/2025 Delivery 
Dimension .15% 19-0-6 30% Polyplus LESCO 153 $30.50 4,666.50$               
(Alt. for 19-0-6 with .15 dimension)
Fertilizer 5-10-31 A/C with 10% FE 50 $41.35 2,067.50$               
LESCO 33-0-3 50% U-PLUS BIO 2Fe 50# 90 NO BID
 (Alt. for 33-3-5 no longer available) 29,341.52$             

The Hogan Company 
7/1/2024 Quantity Bag Ton

TFC MTO 35-3-5 FERTILIZER 50LB 90 $22.14 1,992.60$               
TFC MTO 32-3-8 30% SCU 2% FE FERT. 50LB 74 $26.43 1,955.82$               
Lebabon Pro 0-0-7 .067% Acelepryn MOP SNG 220 105 $46.96 4,930.80$               
TFC MTO 18-24-12 Starter Fert. 25% SCU 130 $27.86 3,621.80$               

3/1/2025
Lebabon Pro 17-0-0 0.15% Dimension 50LB 148 $35.96 5,322.08$               
21-0-0 Ammonium Sulfate Fert. SGN 220 50LB 95 $19.93 1,893.35$               
Lebabon Pro 0-0-7 .067% Acelepryn MOP SNG 220 105 $46.96 4,930.80$               

5/3/2025
Lebabon Pro 17-0-0 0.15% Dimension 50LB 153 $35.96 5,501.88$               
TFC MTO 5-10-31 10% fe SNG 220 50LB 50 $25.00 1,250.00$               
TFC MTO 35-3-5 FERTILIZER 50LB 90 $22.14 1,992.60$               
TOTAL 33,391.73$             

Site One Landscape Supply - Maryville 



Pest Control
CRO #1640
4/23/2024 2 p.m.

Prices per Treatment
Advanced 

Terminte and 
Pest Control Valor Pest Control

Crawltek LLC DBA 
Synergy Pest Mgmt

City Hall 22.00$              60.00$                                           45.00$                    
Police Department 22.00$              -$                                              35.00$                    
Fire Department 22.00$              50.00$                                           35.00$                    
Recreational Buildings 22.00$              56.00$                                           35.00$                    
Palace Theater 22.00$              25.00$                                           35.00$                    
Crossville Depot 22.00$              50.00$                                           35.00$                    

Public Works:
Maintenance Dept. and Bays 22.00$              20.00$                                           35.00$                    
Street Dept. and Kitchen 22.00$              20.00$                                           35.00$                    
Public Works Office and Kitchen 22.00$              20.00$                                           35.00$                    
Utilities Maintenance and Kitchen 22.00$              20.00$                                           35.00$                    
Fire Station #2 22.00$              50.00$                                           35.00$                    
Meadow Park Lake Office 22.00$              50.00$                                           35.00$                    
Airport Terminal Building 22.00$              56.00$                                           35.00$                    
Veolia 22.00$              50.00$                                           35.00$                    

SEASONAL TREATMENTS:
Centennial Park Concessions Buildings and Restrooms 22.00$              50.00$                                           35.00$                    
Meadow Park Lake Bath House 22.00$              20.00$                                           35.00$                    
Meadow Park Lake Cabins 22.00$              20.00$                                           35.00$                    
Meadow Park Lake 
Maintenance Storage 22.00$              20.00$                                           35.00$                    
Duer Soccer Complex 22.00$              50.00$                                           35.00$                    
Garrison Park 22.00$              35.00$                                           35.00$                    
MONTHLY TOTAL 440.00$            722.00$                                        710.00$                 

Street Striping
CRO #1642
4/23/2024 2 p.m.

4" line (per foot) 0.10$                
6" line (per foot) 0.15$                

Thermoplastic:
24" Stop Bar (per foot) 12.00$              
12" crosswalk (per foot) 22.00$              
Turn/straight arrows (each) 350.00$            
4" white or yellow line (per foot) 0.75$                
Rumble strips (per foot) 8.00$                
Word message (per letter) 35.00$              
Single Turn Arrow (each) 225.00$            

Cold Milling
CRO #1644
4/23/2024
2 p.m. CDT

Per ton to 
remove and 
retain millings

Per ton for City to retain millings 
and have delivered

Rogers Group 36.00$              35.00$                                           



Water Line Supplies
CRO# 1634
4/23/2024
2 p.m. CDT

Core & Main G&C Supply Co
Saddles (Smith Blair)
2" x 3/4" cc 23.73$              31.58$                                           
2" x 1" cc 23.73$              31.58$                                           
3" x 3/4" cc 28.64$              40.72$                                           
3" x 1" cc 28.64$              40.72$                                           
3" x 2" I.P.T. 31.36$              49.96$                                           
4" x 3/4" cc 25.28$              40.43$                                           
4" x 1" cc 25.28$              40.43$                                           
4" x 2" I.P.T. 31.45$              45.45$                                           
6" x 3/4" cc 33.96$              48.20$                                           
6" x 1" cc 33.96$              48.20$                                           
6" x 2" I.P.T. 36.29$              55.89$                                           
8" x 3/4" cc 32.80$              52.41$                                           
8" x 1" cc 32.80$              52.41$                                           
8" x 2" I.P.T. 43.19$              65.40$                                           
10" x 3/4" cc 45.21$              61.10$                                           
10" x 1" cc 45.21$              61.10$                                           
10" x 2" I.P.T. 55.15$              68.56$                                           
12" x 3/4" cc 50.50$              64.15$                                           
12" x 1" cc 50.50$              64.15$                                           
12" x 2" I.P.T. 65.18$              81.30$                                           
14" x 3/4" cc 64.87$              75.70$                                           
14" x 1" cc 64.87$              75.77$                                           
14" x 2" I.P.T. 79.02$              92.29$                                           
16" x 3/4" cc 76.99$              89.93$                                           
16" x 1" cc 76.99$              89.93$                                           
16" x 2" I.P.T. 95.37$              111.40$                                         

Master Meter 5/8" x 3/4" No bid No bid 
Master Meter 1" No bid No bid 
Master Meter 1 1/2" No bid No bid 
2" Meter with flange connector No bid No bid 
2" DB compound meter No bid No bid 
3" DB compound meter No bid No bid 
4" DB compound meter No bid No bid 
Corp Stops (Ford) 3/4" F1000-3-Q NL 35.96$              37.73$                                           
Corp Stops (Ford) 3/4" FB1000-3-Q NL, 300 PSI 53.22$              58.98$                                           
Coupling for 3/4" service tubing brass 20.09$              21.47$                                           
3/4" PE Municipex CTS Service Tubing 500' coils (per ft) 1.15$                $465 each or $.93/ft
1" PE Municipex CTS Service Tubing 500' coil (per ft) 1.53$                $715 each or $1.43/ft 
Smith Blair 3/4" x 3" full circle clamp for service tubing 22.50$              32.36$                                           
18" plastic meter box (Carson-Brooks) plastic lid 54.00$              62.25$                                           
3/4" Meter yokes (Ford) 7" rise 188.25$            197.54$                                         

Brass Saddles (Ford)
2" x 3/4" 22.55$              25.44$                                           
2" x 1" 22.55$              25.44$                                           
4" x 3/4" 35.00$              39.50$                                           
4" x 1" 35.00$              39.50$                                           
4" x 2" 75.39$              85.07$                                           
6" x 3/4" 52.23$              58.93$                                           
6" x 1" 52.23$              58.93$                                           
6" x 2" 98.54$              111.20$                                         
8" x 3/4" 71.77$              80.99$                                           
8" x 1" 71.77$              80.99$                                           
10" x 3/4" 138.47$            156.27$                                         
10" x 1" 138.47$            156.27$                                         

2" Ford Setter w/ball valve, w/check valve & bypass (A) 1,107.23$         1,139.65$                                      
2" Ford Setter w/ball valve, w/check valve & bypass (B) 1,142.81$         1,175.59$                                      
17" x 30" plastic meter box 18" 176.73$            269.00$                                         
15" concrete meter box w/C1 reader flip lid No bid 64.35$                                           
1" Ford meter yoke 10" rise w/double check valve w/locking ball 
valve 319.80$            332.43$                                         
Master Meter Register 5/8" USG 3G DS-Optics-NL No bid No bid



Master Meter Register 5/8" USG 3G DS-Interpreter LCD No bid No bid

Octave Meters: No bid No bid
2" Octave Meter No bid No bid
3" Octave Meter No bid No bid
4" Octave Meter No bid No bid
6" Octave Meter No bid No bid
2" Octave Meter No bid No bid
3" Octave Meter No bid No bid
4" Octave Meter No bid No bid
6" Octave Meter No bid No bid

3G DS Encoder XTR 199-004-50 No bid No bid
3G DS Encoder Module 965-010-16 No bid No bid
DLG 3G DS Fast Pulse DLG 199-004-57 No bid No bid
Octobe Double Pulse Output ADA 965-010-19 No bid No bid

Badger Meters:
Badger, M25, 5/8" X 3/4" Disc Meter No bid No bid
Badger M55, 1" Disc Meter No bid No bid
Badger M120, 1-1/2" Disc Meter No bid No bid
Badger, M170, 2" Disc Meter No bid No bid
Badger, 2" T-200 Turbo Series Meter No bid No bid
Badger, 3" T-450 Turbo Series Meter No bid No bid
Badger, 4" T-1000 Turbo Series Meter No bid No bid
Badger, 6" T-2000 Turbo Series Meter No bid No bid
Badger, 2" Compound Series Meter, No bid No bid
Badger, 3" Compound Series Meter No bid No bid
Badger, 4" Compound Series Meter No bid No bid
Badger, 6" Compound Series Meter No bid No bid

No bid

Tires & Installation
CRO #1639
4/23/2024
2 p.m. CDT

Shadden Tire Best One
Passenger and light truck tires 15.00$              55.00$                                           
Medium truck tires 30.00$              80.00$                                           
Medium truck tires with Dayton wheels 30.00$              80.00$                                           
Industrial tires up to 16.5" wheel 15.00$              50.00$                                           
Industrial tires greater than 16.5" wheel 20.00$              75.00$                                           


