Fertilizer
CRO #1450
5/15/2018
10 a.m. CDT

07/02/2018 Delivery

35-3-5 AC

LESCO 32-0-8 30% Polyplus 2FE
(Alt. for 32-3-8 30% SCU 2 FE)
0-0-7 plus Acelepryn 0.067%
LESCO 18-24-12 25% Polyplus
(Alt. for 18-24-12 25% SCU)

03/01/2019 Delivery

Dimension .15% 19-0-6 30% Polyplus LESCO
(Alt. for 19-0-6 with .15 dimension)

21-0-0 AS

0-0-7 plus Acelepryn 0.067%

05/01/2019 Delivery

Dimension .15% 19-0-6 30% Polyplus LESCO
(Alt. for 19-0-6 with .15 dimension)

5-10-31 with 10% FE

35-3-5 AC

Quantity

90
74

105
130

148

95
105
152

50
90

Site One Landscape
Supply

Bag

Ton

$ 13.833
$ 17.217

No bid
$ 18.098

$ 19.662

$ 14.903

$ 25.307

$ 19.662

$ 18.993
$ 13.833

$ 1,244.97
$ 1,274.06

No bid
$ 2,352.74

$ 2,909.98
$ 1,415.79
$ 2,657.24
$ 2,988.62

$ 949.65
$ 1,244.97

$17,038.02

07/02/2018 Delivery

35-3-5 AC

32-3-8 30% SCU 2 FE

0-0-7 plus Acelepryn 0.067%
18-24-12 25% SCU

03/01/2019 Delivery

ProScape 20-0-8 with .15 dimension
(Alt. for 19-0-6)

21-0-0 AS

0-0-7 plus Acelepryn 0.067%

05/01/2019 Delivery

ProScape 20-0-819-0-6 with .15 dimension
(Alt. for 19-0-6)

5-10-31 with 10% FE

35-3-5 AC

Quantity
90
74
105
130
148
95
105

153

50
90

The Hogan Co.

Bag

Ton

B HH P

17.34
22.89
34.69
23.51

30.10

12.00

34.69

30.10

16.25
17.34

D B BB

$
$

1,560.60
1,693.86
3,642.45
3,056.30

4,454.80

1,140.00

3,642.45

4,605.30

812.50
1,560.60

$26,168.86



Advanced
Turf Solutions

Quantity Bag Ton
07/02/2018 Delivery
ATS 34-0-4 ALL MINERAL (Alternate for 35-3-5) 90 $11.30 $ 1,017.00
ATS 30-0-4 w/ZnB 30% XCU 74 $1319 $ 976.06
(Alt. for 32-3-8 30% SCU 2 FE)
0-0-7 plus Acelepryn 0.067% 105 No bid No bid
ATS 16/28/12 w/ZnB 30% PSCU 130 $15.81 $ 2,055.30
(Alt. for 18-24-12 25% SCU)
03/01/2019 Delivery
EC 20-0-10 .19% Dim/75%PCSCU/150SGN 148 $33.69 $ 4,986.12
(Alt. for 19-0-6 with .15 dimension)
MC 21-0-0 Ammonium Sulfate 95 $10.71 $ 1,017.45
(Alt. for 21-0-0 As)
0-0-7 plus Acelepryn 0.067% 105 No bid No bid
05/01/2019 Delivery
EC 20-0-10 .19% Dim/75%PCSCU/150SGN 153 $33.69 $ 5,154.57
(Alt. for 19-0-6 with .15 dimension)
ATS 18-2-24 1% FE/75%NUT/150SGN 50 $33.30 $ 1,665.00
(Alt. for 5-10-31 with 10% FE)
ATS 34-0-4 ALL MINERAL 90 $11.30 $ 1,017.00
35-3-5 AC

$17,888.50
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