Drug Screens
CRO #1253
05/15/2013
2:00 p.m.
CMC Occ. Med.* E & A Solutions Advanced Drug Screening ExacCare
Non-CDL CDL Non-CDL CDL Non-CDL CDL Non-CDL CDL
Random-Safety Sensitive Employees S 25.00 $ 33.00 S 32.00|$ 32.00 no bid S 25.00 S 45.00 | $ 35.00
Random-CDL S 37.50 S 32.00 S 40.00 S 35.00
Blood Alcohol-CDL S 23.00 $ 25.00 S 15.00 no bid
Drug Screens:
Post-Accident w/injury S 25.00 $ 33.00 S 32.00|S$ 32.00 S 25.00|S$ 25.00 S 4500 S 45.00
Post-Accient w/o injury S 25.00 $ 33.00 S 32.00|$ 32.00 $ 25.00|$ 25.00 S 45.00 | $ 45.00
Reasonable Suspicion S 25.00 $ 33.00 S 32.00|S$ 32.00 S 25.00|S$ 25.00 S 4500 | S 45.00
Outside regular office hours $ 150.00 $ 182.00 | $ 182.00 $ 25.00|$ 25.00 no bid no bid
Post-Employment Offer w/Physical S 108.00 $ 120.50 $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 no bid no bid S 143.00 | $ 143.00
Turn-around time see proposal 1-2 days same day 3 days
MRO & Laboratory Dr. Varcak/CMC Dr. Kowal/Meditox Dr. Miles/Meditox Dr. Jensen/LabCorp
C.L.ILA. certified yes yes yes CLIA waived
* See proposal Crossville, TN Lebanon, TN Crossville Crossville




