Water Treatment Chemicals

CRO #1637
4/23/2024
2 pm CDT
ZINC-ORTHO SODIUM SODIUM SODIUM NORIT
Vendor Caustic Caustic PHOSPHATE | FLUROSILICIC | BICARBONATE | GRANULAR SALT| POLMER | PERMANGANATE| THIOSULFATE PAC
(GAL) 50% | (GAL) 25% (GAL) ACID (GAL) (POUND) BULK (POUND) (GAL) TOTE (GAL) (GAL) (POUND)
Corechem Inc $3.2930 $1.1440 no bid $4.4390 no bid $0.1240 no bid no bid $4.2670 no bid
Univar Solutions $4.9500 no bid no bid $3.5200 $0.7240 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Shannon Chemical no bid no bid $10.2700 $4.4700 no bid no bid no bid $11.7300 no bid no bid
Carus Corp no bid no bid $8.9100 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Chemrite Inc no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $11.4200 no bid no bid
Brenntag Mid-South $3.9570 $1.3800 $19.7700 $4.2350 $0.4300 no bid no bid $13.3500 $3.5000 no bid
Dycho Company $4.0400 $1.5600 $10.0800 $3.8000 $0.4100 $0.1700 no bid $11.3000 $4.0500 $1.3700
Hawkins Inc $4.3200 no bid no bid $6.5000 no bid no bid no bid $16.6400 $9.5000 no bid
Southeastern Tank $5.1900 $2.7802 no bid $4.1162 no bid no bid no bid $18.9500 no bid no bid
Thermodyne no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $3.3520 no bid no bid no bid
Notes: Corechem's salt does not meet our spec requirements




