Quotation

Log Number AM-2024-3774-0
Created Date 9/12/2024
Last Modified Date 9/12/2024, 11:44 AM
Delivery address: Invoice address:
Crossville, TN Crossville, TN

Darian Dykes

486 Sparta Highway
Crossville, TN 38572
United States

931-484-6257

darian.dykes@veolia.com

Project Description

Project Name: Crossville, TN
Project Number: 10-0010
Moadels: 2 x NX150-C070
Sal
Item 'Quantity Produ'c t - Product Code Betails a.es Tgtal
Description Price Price

Internal Harmonic Filter MTE NX150, MatrixAP 480Vac 60Hz 208
Amps, Open c/w contactor option.
) Includes: Power cables, Mounting Panel, and hardware.
Harmonic USD UsD
1) 200]Filter SRYGOEIA-DOIEL | & oiimated Lastinis:10:04 weiles 18,275.00 | 36,550.00
Upgrade
Please note that the Harmonic Filter will be relocated to the interior of
the blower. Because of obligation a Certified Electrician or Site
Electrician will be required to bypass external harmonic filter.
On-Site Visit for one tech for 3 days to install the harmonic filter into
On-Site blower and perform harmonic analysis. 3 Days is an estimation, usbD usD
2 3.00 SRV - :
Visit e additional days @ $1,500.00 per tech per day to be adjusted on the 1,500.00 | 4,500.00
final invoice.
Travel Estimated travel expenses for one tech for 3 days. To be adjusted on usbD usb
: -0009.0
3 10n Expenses SRYO00TH final invoice. 1,650.00| 1,650.00
Travel 3 . . e usD usD
4 1.00 Time SRV00014-0006.0 | Estimated travel time for one tech. To be adjusted on final invoice. 940.00 940.00
5 1.00 | Shippin SRV00012-0002.0 | Estimated Shipping. To be adjusted on final invoice e e
‘ PRIRG ' RpIng: ! e 995.00  995.00

Subtotal USD 44,635.00
Total Price USD 44,635.00
Grand Total USD 44,635.00

Price does not include applicable taxes

Quote Prepared By Expiration Date

Kevin Chamberlain 12/11/2024

Special Projects Coordinator

APG, Inc.
1270, Michéle-Bohec, Blainville J7C 554
Tel: 450 938-0799 Fax: 450 939-2115 Website: www.apg-neuros.com



Quotation
Log Number AM-2024-3774-0
Created Date 9/12/2024
Last Modified Date 9/12/2024, 11:44 AM

® Payment method: CK, Wire transfer, Credit card
® Payment: Net 30 Days
¢ Shipping: PPA

Thank you for choosing APG-Neuros!

APG, Inc.
1270, Michéle-Bohec, Blainville J7C 5S4
Tel: 450 939-0799 Fax: 450 939-2115 Website: www.apg-neuros.com



O VEOLIA Hinch, Kimberly <kimberly.hinch@veolia.com>

Neuros Blower
1 message

Dykes, Darian <darian.dykes@veolia.com>
To: Kimberly Hinch <kimberly.hinch@veolia.com>

7 October 2024 at 09:51

(/\) ARTECHE

O POWER QUALITY

Arteche PQ Inc. Phone: 262-754-3883
16964 W. Victor Rd. Fax: 262-754-3993
New Berlin, WI 53151 www.artechepg.com

PERFORMANCE OF LOW PASS HARMONIC FILTER:

UL FILE: E189894

MODEL: LPF 0150 480 KB N1 H2
SERIAL: S10540-2

POWER: 150HP

VOLTAGE: 480V

PHASE: 3

FUNDAMENTAL LOAD: 210A
FREQUENCY: 60Hz

CAPACITOR CONNECTION: WYE
SERVICE: INDOOR

|IEEE Compliant. Operation Temperature -10C to +50C
Discharge resistance to 50 Volts in 1 minute. No PCB's.
Manufactured in the United States of America 3

Enclosed Industrial Centrol Panel

LISTED
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O VEOLIA Hinch, Kimberly <kimberly.hinch@veolia.com>

Fwd: Neuros Blowers????
1 message

Dykes, Darian <darian.dykes@veolia.com> 16 September 2024 at 08:41
To: Kimberly Hinch <kimberly.hinch@veolia.com>

Darian Dykes

Project Manager-Crossville, TN

Veolia

468 Sparta Highway

Crossville, TN 38572

Office: 931-484-6257 Fax: 931-456-6088
Cell: 931-510-1934
darian.dykes@veolia.com

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Chris Jones <Chris@jtguthrie.com>
Date: Mon, Sep 16, 2024 at 7:20 AM

Subject: RE: Neuros Blowers????

To: Dykes, Darian <darian.dykes@veolia.com>

I don't know of any other alternates to Neuros, sorry.

Chris Jones

GUTHRIE SALES & SERVICE
7003 Chadwick Dr #300, Brentwood, TN 37027
Mobile 615.478.8190

Email: chris@jtguthrie.com | Website: www.jtguthrie.com

From: Dykes, Darian <darian.dykes@veolia.com>
Sent: Friday, September 13, 2024 11:31 AM

To: Chris Jones <Chris@jtguthrie.com>

Subject: Neuros Blowers??7?

Good morning Chris? Do you know of a different company that the Neuros Blowers would interchange parts on the
blowers we have? The City Manager has asked me to make sure this is a Sole Source piece of equipment.

Thanks!!!!

Darian Dykes



