CITY OF CROSSVILLE, TN

Crushed Stone
CRO #1486
5/15/2019

10 a.m. CDT

33C 3/4 inch
(Delivered to Public Works)

Lhoist North America $ 1350 $ 17.25

Rogers Group $ 1225 $ 14.95

33C 3/4inch
(Picked up by City truck)

Lhoist North America $ 925 $ 13.00

Rogers Group $ 775 $ 1045

11/2inch 1/2inch

$ 1650 $ 17.25

No bid $ 14.95

11/2inch 1/2inch

$ 1225 $ 13.00

No bid $ 10.45

1/4 inch

$ 13.50

No bid

1/4 inch

$ 925

No bid

Rip Rap

No bid

$ 17.30

Rip Rap

No bid

$ 12.80

RCA 02
2X4

No bid

N/A

RCA 02
2X4

No bid

No bid

RCA 71
4X6

#2 Stone
1-1/2" x 3"

$ 18.00 $

N/A

RCA 71
4X6

$

17.50

14.15

#2 Stone
1-1/2" x 3"

$ 1375 $

No bid

$

13.25

9.65
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