CITY OF CROSSVILLE, TN

Police Uniforms

CRO #1505
3/24/2020
2:00 p.m.
Summit Galls, LLC | CMS GT Distributors,
Uniforms Uniforms & |Inc.
Eauib. Inc.
Dress - (Class A)
Trousers $ 3675 |$ 4000 | § 31.00 | NoBid
#3900
Shirt
Long Sleeve $ 4500 | $ 50.00 | $ 45.12 | No Bid
#34IN78862
Shirt
Short Sleeve $ 3900 |$ 45.00 | $ 28.85 | NoBid
#UDI2000
Tie $  365|$ 6.00 | $ 3.95 | No Bid
#90010
Duty Uniform
Trousers $ 5800 $ 65.00 | $ 54.70 | No Bid
Shir #8666
Long Sleeve $ 57.00|$ 65.00 | $ 51.47 | No Bid
#8671
Shirt
Short Sleeve $ 5200 |$ 6500 |$ 46.75 | No Bid
#8676
Other
Jackets
$ 8800 |$  86.00]$ 70.95 | No Bid Galls-Rothco
Winter Special Ops
#613902986909 or
eaual
#9767
Windbreaker $ 4200 | $ 11000 | $ 78.00 | No Bid
#ROT8720
Equipment
Holster, Duty $ 9500 | $ 95.00 | $ 103.00 | $ 74.99
Mag Pouch $ 2200 $ 3600 $ 3060 | $ 27.29
Cap
Cold Weather $ 900 |$ 1000 |$ 6.50 | No Bid
#C918
Boots, Duty $ 12500 | $ 130.00 | $ 121.05 | § 108.24
#23824
Boots, Winter $ 131.00 | $ 138.00 | $ 12765 | § 114.12
#23827
Accessories
Wallet $ 12.00 | NoBid $ 15.00 | $ 19.80
#DK71
Duty Belt $ 4500 | $ 4200 | $ 4850 | § 33.75
#1021U
Belt Buckle $ 6.00 | NoBid $ 500 [$ 6.24
#9002/#9001
ASP $ 97.00 | $ 105.00 | $ 102.00 | § 86.29
#52411
ASP Holder $ 3500 |$ 3800 |$ 38.00  $ 31.20
#52433
Lt. / Cpt. Bars $ 500 | $§ 5.00 | $§ 3.00 § 9.75
#P1300
Chevrons
Sgt. $ 500§ 5.00 | $ 3.00 $ 9.75
#P304
Corporal / Private $ 5.00 | $ 5.00 | $ 3.00 $ 9.75
#P301/P303
Insignia-Gold $ 10.00 | $ 2500 | $ 9.60 | $ 9.04
#A7395
Insignia-Silver $ 1000 | $ 20.00 | $ 9.60 | $ 9.04
#A7395
Nameplate-Gold $ 1099 | $ 1200 | $ 11.00 | No Bid
#50
Nameplate-Silver $ 1099 | $ 1200 | $ 11.00 | No Bid
#50
Service Since Pin-Gold $ 1099 | $ 1200 | $ 13.30 | No Bid
#YD
Service Since Pin-Silver $ 1099 | $ 12.00 | $ 13.30 | No Bid
#YD
Badges
Shirt, Hi Glo $ 73.00 | $ 8500 |$ 72.00 | $ 68.74
#B296
Shirt, Rho-Glo $ 73.00 | $ 8500 |$ 72.00 | $ 68.74
#B296
Badge Holder, Clip On $ 1400 | $ 1000 | $ 9.10 $ 15.20
#5301
Badge Holder, w/Chain $ 1500 | $ 1000 | $ 9.10 ' $ 15.20
#5303
Patches, City of Crossville $ 135 | TBD $ 1.15 | NoBid
TOTAL BID $1253.71 | § 1,424.00 | § 124824 $ 71713 | $ - $ -
larger sizes

extra chg |
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