CRO# 1212 Water Meters
6/5/2012
2:00 p.m.

Water Meter (Master Meter) 5/8" X 3/4" 3GDS Radio Read Meter USG

5/8" X 3/4" (Master Meter) BLO5-1V2-AAA-2
(BL Acculinx USG w/5' Itron Connection)

1" (Master Meter) BL0O9-1V2-AAA-2
(BL Acculinx USG w/5' Itron Connection)

1" (Master Meter) 4310-GBL-091-MD-AAA-2 3GDS
11/2" (Master Meter) MJ11-1GD-AAA-2 USG 3GDS
2" Meter with Flange Connector MJ13-1Gd-AAA-2USG 3GDS
2" DB Compound DC 13-13D-AAB-2-USG-3GDS

3" DB Compound DC 14-13D-AAB-2-USG-3GDS

4" DB Compound DC 15-13D-AAB-2-USG-3GDS
Master Meter Register 5/8" USG 3G DS-Optis

2" Octave Meter w/radio read package

3" Octave Meter w/radio read package

4" Octave Meter w/radio read package

6" Octave Meter w/radio read package

3G Fast Pulse

2" Octave Meter GPM #139-125-09

3" Octave Meter GPM #139-325-09

4" Octave Meter GPM #139-425-09
6" Octave Meter GPM

HD Supply Waterworks
$165.42

$113.54

$163.77
$222.18
$396.16
$518.09
$1,679.56
$2,132.36
$2,724.37
$135.00
$1,473.25
$1,651.00
$1,820.12
$2,651.00
$250.00
$1,322.93
$1,500.00

$1,669.12
$2,500.00

Hayes Pipe & Supply
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid



