
CITY OF CROSSVILLE, TN

CHEMICALS

CRO #1523

5/13/2020

10:00 a.m.

ZINC-ORTHO SODIUM SODIUM SODIUM SODIUM NORIT

VENDOR CAUSTIC CAUSTIC PHOSPHATE FLUROSILICIC BICARBONATE GRANULAR SALT POLYMER PERMANGANATE PERMANGANATE THIOSULFATE PAC

(GAL)-50% (GAL)-25% (GAL) ACID (GALLON) (POUND) BULK (POUND) (GALLON) Barrel Tote (GALLON) (POUND)

Corechem Inc. 2.5820$                                     1.1250$        no bid 2.3970$                       0.2880$                  0.1140$                          no bid 568.70$                 2,843.50$              2.5930$            no bid

Univar USA, Inc. 2.1480$                                     1.0461$        no bid 2.7850$                       no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Thermodyne Engineering Inc. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 3.3520$           no bid no bid no bid no bid

Shannon Chemical Corp. * no bid no bid 4.6200$                4.4700$                       no bid no bid no bid 513.15$                 2,384.25$              no bid no bid

Carus Corporation* no bid no bid 4.6750$                no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Aulick Chemical Solutions no bid no bid no bid 3.7600$                       no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Specialty Chemical Co. LLC* 2.6500$                                     1.3100$        no bid 4.7200$                       0.3800$                  no bid no bid no bid no bid 5.7300$            no bid

American Development Corp* 3.6190$                                     2.2470$        no bid 3.6200$                       no bid no bid no bid $9.25/gal $9.05/gal 5.2500$            no bid

Brenntag Mid-South* 2.0000$                                     0.9960$        No bid 4.3100$                       0.4000$                  no bid no bid $10.93/gal $10.93/gal 3.5200$            no bid

Geo Specialty Chemicals no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Sterling Water Technologies no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

*see exceptions


