CITY OF CROSSVILLE, TN

CHEMICALS

CRO #1594

4/19/2022

2p.m. CDT
ZINC-ORTHO SODIUM SODIUM SODIUM NORIT
VENDOR CAUSTIC CAUSTIC PHOSPHATE FLUROSILICIC BICARBONATE GRANULAR SALT POLYMER| PERMANGANATE| THIOSULFATE PAC
(GAL)-50%]| (GAL)-25% (GAL) ACID (GALLON) (POUND) BULK (POUND) (GALLON) Tote (GALLON) (POUND)
Corechem Inc. $5.3800 $1.9650 no bid $4.0220 $0.4060 $0.2390 no bid no bid $6.1200 no bid
Univar USA, Inc. no bid $1.5333 no bid $4.5600 $0.7627 no bid no bid no bid $6.6700 no bid
Thermodyne Engineering Inc. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid| $ 3.9720 no bid no bid no bid
Shannon Chemical Corp. * no bid no bid| $ 12.17 7.33 no bid no bid no bid | $ 21.37 no bid no bid
Carus Corporation* no bid no bid| $ 10.01 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Specialty Chemical Co. LLC* no bid $2.0650 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Chemrite Inc* no bid no bid $13.3430 no bid no bid no bid no bid $15.730 no bid no bid
Brenntag Mid-South* $10.0800 $2.0800 No bid no bid $0.5400 no bid no bid $28.230 $6.0600 no bid
Dycho Company Inc* $4.1200 $1.5800| $12.50 or $13.50 $2.90 or $3.33 $.44 or $.52 $0.1700 no bid | $12.76 or $13.54| $3.89 or $4.60 $1.0500
Hawkins Inc| $ 4.47 2.17 No bid 4.09 no bid no bid no bid | $ 1464 | $ 12.37 no bid

*see exceptions




